






BOROUGH OF LANSDALE

TREASURER'S REPORT

AS OF SEPTEMBER 30, 2016

TD Bank

 Operating Account 5,358,915.82$    

 ACH Deposit Account 279,773.89 

 Credit Card Deposit Account 787,838.52 

 Payroll Account 27,893.98 

Univest

 Utility Payment Lockbox Account 965,482.05 

 Parking Meter Collections 691,351.84 

 Reserves 7,434,418.69        

PLGIT 747.54 

US Bank 3,475,705.32        

PLUS: Deposit in Transit (TD Bank) 4,843.53$     

Deposit in Transit (Credit Cards) 121,983.63 

LESS: Outstanding Checks - Accounts Payable (505,370.22)          

Outstanding Checks - Payroll (12,600.95) 

Cash In Bank 18,630,983.64$    

Beginning Balance 16,866,644.37$    

ADD:    Receipts/Transfers 7,314,091.93$    

LESS:  Disbursements/Transfers (5,549,752.66)$     

Ending Balance - Total per Borough 18,630,983.64$    

























UTILITY ENGINEERS, PC
861 St. John’s Road, Suite 6, Drums, PA 18222
(570) 788-2211 (570) 788-2277 Fax

September 28, 2016

Mr. Jacob Ziegler, Borough Manager
BOROUGH OF LANSDALE
645 West Ninth Street
Lansdale, PA 19446

Re: PURCHASE OF 145,000 VOLT CIRCUIT BREAKERS,
34,500 VOLT CIRCUIT BREAKERS and 34,500 VOLT
VOLTAGE REGULATORS.

Dear Mr. Ziegler:

On September 13, 2016, material bids were received for the referenced project.
Contained herein is our evaluation of these bids and our recommendations for award.

The material bid package was separated into three (3) sections; Section 1 was for a
145,000 Volt Circuit Breaker, Section 2 was for a 34,500 Volt Circuit Breaker and
Section 3 was for 34,500 Volt Voltage Regulators. The bidders were invited to submit
bids for the entire package or separately for the individual sections. Each section
required separate pricing for both the material (base bid) and field service by a qualified
service technician. Section No. 3 requested additional pricing for several options.

A total of seven (7), Request For Bids (RFB) were received from interested vendors and
manufacturers. All seven (7) vendors/manufacturers submitted bids in response to this
request.

The results of this RFB are as follows:

Section No. 1 – 145,000 Volt SF6 Circuit Breaker

A total of six (6) bids were received for Section No. 1.  See the attached Material Bid
Results spread sheet for the bid results.  The base bids ranged from $48,995 to $59,460.

The apparent low bid was submitted by the joint venture of GE Grid Solutions and
Alstom Grid, Inc. in the amount of $48,995 plus $4,700 for field service for a total bid
amount of $53,695. GE/Alstom is providing an Alstom circuit breaker. The GE/Alstom
bid is responsive in that it is in compliance with the technical specifications and no
material exceptions were taken.
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The second low bid was submitted by PEPCO in the amount of $53,940. Pricing for field
service is included in the submitted base bid of the circuit breaker. PEPCO is providing a
Siemens circuit breaker.  The PEPCO bid is responsive in that it is in compliance with the
technical specifications and no material exceptions were taken.

The remaining submitted bids were higher in price. Please refer to the attached Material
Bid Results sheet for the all bid results.

Section No.2 –34,500 Volt Vacuum Circuit Breaker

A total of four (4) bids were received for Section No. 2.  See the attached Material Bid
Results spread sheet for the bid results.  The base bids ranged from $26,084 to $27,925.

GENERGY submitted the apparent low bid in the amount of $26,084 plus $2,100 for
field service for a total bid amount of $28,184. GENERGY is offering a Siemens circuit
breaker.  The GENERGY bid is responsive in that it is in compliance with the technical
specifications and no material exceptions were taken.

The second low bid was received from PEPCO in the amount of $26,890. PEPCO did not
provide a price quote for field service and, as such, is non-compliant with the bid
documents.

The third low bid was submitted by Schaedler YESCO for $27,925 plus $3,000 for field
services for a total cost of $30,925.  The Schaedler YESCO bid is compliance with the
technical specifications and no material exceptions were taken. Schaedler YESCO is also
providing a Siemens circuit breaker.

The fourth bid was submitted by Denney’s Electric in the amount of $34,694.
Denney’s Electric is providing a Siemens circuit breaker and their bid is also compliant
with the technical specifications.

Section No.3 –34,500 Volt Voltage Regulators

Eight (8) bids were received for this section.  Separate pricing was requested for the base
bid and field services.  In addition to submitting a base bid and a field services bid, each
vendor was requested to provide pricing for several options.
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For this section, the base bids ranged from $55,612.50 to $68,982.00.  See the attached
Material Bid Results spread sheet for the complete bid results.

Anixter Inc. submitted the two (2) apparent low bids, a base bid and an alternate bid.
Anixter Inc. did not provide the required bid bonds or quotes for field services.  Both
Anixter bids are non-compliant with the bid documents and cannot be considered.

The next apparent low bids were received from PEPCO. PEPCO also submitted a base
bid and an alternate bid. PEPCO did not provide a price quote for field service on both
the base bid and alternate bid and, as such, is non-compliant with the bid documents.

GENERGY submitted a base bid in the amount of $63,735.00, $5,250.00 for field
services and $8,688.00 for requested options for a total of $77,673.00. GENERGY is
offering a Siemens voltage regulator.  The GENERGY bid is responsive in that it is in
compliance with the technical specifications and no material exceptions were taken.

Denney’s Electric submitted a base bid in the amount of $63,900.00, $5,264.00 for field
services and $8,910.00 for the requested options for a total of $78,074.00.  Denney’s
Electric is offering a Siemens voltage regulator.  The Denney’s Electric bid is responsive
in that it is in compliance with the technical specifications and no material exceptions
were taken.

The balance of the bids for this section are higher in price. Please refer to the attached
material Bid results sheet for all bid results

Recommendation for award

The Borough has expressed a preference to have all circuit breakers at the main
substation to be of the same manufacturer for system consistency and to facilitate
maintenance and repair services.  In 2015, the Borough purchased several Siemens
manufactured circuit breakers for the main substation.  Since the circuit breakers that
will be purchased under this bid will also be installed at the main substation, our
recommendation is to purchase Siemens circuit breakers.
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For Section No. 1, 145,000 Volt SF6 Circuit Breaker, the low bid was submitted by
GE/Alstom in the amount of $53,695.00.  This is for an Alstom manufactured circuit
breaker. PEPCO submitted a bid of $53,940.00 for a Siemens circuit breaker. For an
additional $245.00, the Borough can purchase a Siemens circuit breaker.  To be
consistent with the previous circuit breakers purchased, we recommend that Section No.
1 be awarded to PEPCO in the amount of $53,940.00.

For Section No. 2, 34,500 Volt Vacuum Circuit Breaker, we recommend that GENERGY
be awarded the bid in the amount of $28,184.00. GENERGY is the lowest responsible
bidder for this section. GENERGY is providing a Siemens circuit breaker that is identical
to the previous circuit breaker purchased by the Borough.

For Section No. 3, 34,500 Volt Voltage Regulators, GENERGY submitted the lowest
responsible bid of $77,673.00.  GENERGY’s bid is for Siemens voltage regulators and is
inclusive of field service and options.  We recommend that GENERGY be awarded
Section No. 3

If you have any questions, please do not hesitate to call.

UTILITY ENGINEERS, PC

Norman P. Baron, PE

cc: Andrew Krauss, Electric Superintendent
James Havrilla, PE



MATERIAL BID RESULTS
FOR

PURCHASE OF CIRCUIT BREAKERS & VOLTAGE REGULATORS
BOROUGH OF LANSDALE, PENNSYLVANIA

BID OPENING DATE: SEPTEMBER 13, 2016

SPECIFICATION SECTIONS 1, 2 AND 3

BID SPECIFICATION SECTION  NO. 1 SPECIFICATION SECTION NO. 2 SPECIFICATION SECTION NO. 3

SECURITY 145KV CIRCUIT BREAKER 34.5KV CIRCUIT BREAKER 34.5KV VOLTAGE REGULATORS

BID AMOUNTS BID AMOUNTS BID AMOUNTS

NO. BIDDER (YES/NO) BASE BID FIELD SERVICE TOTAL BID BASE BID FIELD SERVICE TOTAL BID BASE BID FIELD SERVICE OPTIONS TOTAL BID

1 ANIXTER NO NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $57,484.38 NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NON-COMPLIANT

2 ANIXTER - ALTERNATE NO NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $55,612.50 NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NON-COMPLIANT

3 DENNEY'S ELECTRIC YES $55,079.00 $2,106.00 $57,185.00 $27,457.00 $7,237.00 $34,694.00 $63,900.00 $5,264.00 $8,910.00 $78,074.00

4 GE GRID SOLUTIONS YES $48,995.00 $4,700.00 $53,695.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5 GENERGY YES $54,936.00 $2,100.00 $57,036.00 $26,084.00 $2,100.00 $28,184.00 $63,735.00 $5,250.00 $8,688.00 $77,673.00

6 PEPCO YES $53,940.00 INCLUDED $53,940.00 $26,890.00 NO QUOTE NON-COMPLIANT $58,500.00 NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NON-COMPLIANT

7 PEPCO - ALTERNATE YES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $62,580.00 NO QUOTE $8,310.00 NON-COMPLIANT

8 SCHAEDLER YESCO YES $55,995.00 $4,400.00 $60,395.00 $27,925.00 $3,000.00 $30,925.00 $64,965.00 $5,500.00 $9,360.00 $79,825.00

9 WESCO DISTRIBUTION YES $59,460.00 $4,540.00 $64,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $68,982.00 $5,681.00 $9,432.00 $84,095.00

10

Prepared by:

UTILITY ENGINEERS, PC
861 SAINT JOHN'S ROAD, SUITE 6
DRUMS, PA 18222
TEL: (570) 788-2211     FAX: (570) 788-2277
































